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PREAMBLE: 
The Biology Department holds paramount the openness, fairness and objectivity of its 
evaluations of faculty members for promotion and tenure. No evidence regarding a 
candidate's performance or character, positive or negative, which is not documented in the 
dossier or other university records will be considered in deliberations and recommendations 
for tenure or promotion. Anonymous accounts and hearsay are thus inadmissible. 

I: Biology Department policy for formation and procedures of the Promotion and 
Tenure-Review Committee-

The Biology Department has developed the following modifications, clarifications and 
additions to the University Policies and Procedures for Promotion of Tenured and 
Tenurable Faculty (MTSU Policy 205.V.B). 

a) In the Biology Department one committee, designated as the Promotion and Tenure
Committee ("the committee"), will review and make recommendations on all applications for
promotion and/or tenure, as well as conduct third-year pre-tenure reviews and annual
evaluations for untenured tenure track faculty whose academic appointment is in the
Biology Department.

b) Neither candidates applying for tenure and/or promotion, the department chairperson,
nor faculty members holding administrative appointments at the college level or above may
be members of the committee.

c) The committee will be made-up of ten, tenured Associate Professors and Professors,
who will serve a one-year term, except for the vice-Chair (see below). Given that there are
approximately three times more Professors than Associate Professors, and in order to
reduce the burden of service on the latter, representation ·on the committee will be
proportional to the numbers at each rank who are eligible to serve on the committee (as per
lb).



d) All tenured faculty are eligible to serve on the P& T committee.

e) Candidates for the P&T committee must be willing to participate in all activities of the
committee, including attendance at all meetings and voting on all candidates, to participate
in peer teaching evaluation, and also to participate in annual and third-year reviews of
untenured faculty. Habitual unexcused absenteeism (more than two meetings in a row or
five total) will result in removal from the committee.

f) A committee chairperson for the subsequent academic year will be elected by the
members of the committee at the final committee meeting of the year (usually early spring
semester).

g) The new P& T Chair will call for nominations for the subsequent years committee prior to
the end of the spring semester.

h) Election of committee members will take place at the last faculty meeting of the academic

year (May). The P& T chair will compose a ballot of all nominees and distribute it to all

tenure-track and tenured faculty in the department. All full time tenured and tenure track

faculty will be eligible to vote for 9 committee members in the proportions indicated in (c).

The committee will be composed of the top vote earners as long as the committee

composition represents all departmental domains (Biology Education; Cellular Biology and

Molecular Genetics; Ecology and Evolutionary Biology; Microbiology; Toxicology and

Physiology). If a specific subdiscipline is unrepresented, then the representative candidate

with the most votes will replace the lowest vote earner while keeping the proportional

representation of Associate vs. Full Professors.

i) All candidates' dossiers will be available through Faculty Success for review by P& T
committee members.

j) All committee members will review and vote for candidates applying for tenure and
for promotion to Associate Professor and for renewal of tenure-track faculty.

k) Only Full Professors will review and vote for candidates applying for promotion to Full
Professor. During P& T committee discussions and voting on individuals applying for Full
Professor, Associate Professors should not be present.

I) For purposes of deliberation and voting seven committee members will constitute a quorum
for votes on tenure and/or promotion to Associate professor, and four for votes on promotion
to Full Professor. Committee members submitting a proxy (see I) and those abstaining from
votes count towards the quorum, but abstentions do not count as either positive or negative
votes.

m) When committee members are unable to attend a meeting, proxy votes will be allowed,
but must be provided in writing to the committee chair prior to the meeting.



n) Prior to voting on tenure or promotion for a candidate, the committee will meet with the 
tenured faculty to discuss candidates under evaluation and obtain feedback that may inform 
the committee's vote. Feedback from the faculty should be limited to discussion of the 
candidate's P&T dossier and other information recorded in university documents.

o) The committee chair will prepare a letter of evaluation and/or recommendation for 
tenure and/or promotion, addressing strengths and weaknesses in the areas of teaching, 
research and service, will be prepared by the committee chair for each dossier reviewed. 
Drafts of the letters will be circulated to the committee members eligible to vote on the case 
for comment and revision. A final version of the letter will be approved by majority vote of 
eligible members of the committee before submission to the administration.

p) The vote tallies supporting a candidate for tenure and/or promotion and approving the 
resultant evaluation letter will be reported in the recommendation letter. A tie vote is 
considered a"non-supporting" vote according to university policies.

q) In the event of a non-unanimous decision, the minority may prepare a dissenting letter 
that will be in included in the P& T packet as it goes forward. If no letter is written, the 
minority's choice not to write one will be noted in the committee chair's letter.
II: Biology Department Definition of National Recognition (MTSU Policy 205.VI.D) 

The Biology Department considers the dissemination of knowledge through high quality, 
·-peer--revieweffpublicafions lo befhe prffnary criterion by wnicn research7scholarsnip

activity of its faculty will be judged. Metrics are available from organizations/companies
such as Thompson-Reuters, Scopus and GoogleScholar which provide independent,
objective and commensurable evidence of research quantity and quality. A document
outlining best practices ("What is a quality publication?") is available to candidates for 
promotion/tenure. The Biology Department respects academic freedom and does not 
consider the subject matter of a publication as long as it is pertinent to science, although 
evidence of a coherent, progressing research program is desirable. Because there is no 
single factor that indicates whether a candidate's research/scholarship has garnered 
"national recognition," the Biology Department will consider the following different sources 
of evidence: 

a) Research publications in high quality, peer-reviewed journals. Numbers of citations and
the Impact Factor of the journal should be reported in the OFD. If a candidate does not feel
that these metrics fairly reflect the merit of his/her published work, then this should be
explained in the OFD.

b) Publication of peer-reviewed book chapters or books by recognized academic or trade
presses. Numbers of citations should be reported in the OFD. If book reviews are
available, those could be included in the supporting documents.

c) Invited or plenary presentations before one's professional peers at national or
international meetings/conferences/symposia. Evidence that a presentation meets these












